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Purpose  
  
The purpose aims to articulate the position of Career Academy of Utah (the “School”) 
on the dual enrollment of students in both the School and in a private school, home 
school, or another public school. The School desires to accommodate students 
seeking to dually enroll to pursue educational opportunities not currently available at 
the School. Still, the School wants to ensure that the dual enrollment of its students 
does not create negative financial implications for the School.  

  
  

Policy  
  
For purposes of this policy, “dual enrollment” or “dually enroll(ed)” means a student 
who is enrolled simultaneously in the School and in (1) a private school; (2) home 
school; or (3) another public school.  

  
Consistent with Utah Code §§ 53G-6-702 and 53G-6-703 and Utah Administrative 
Code Rule R277-438, students may be dually enrolled in both the School and in a 
private school, home school, or another public school under the conditions set forth 
herein if there is, in the School’s discretion, a reasonable educational basis for the 
dual enrollment.  

  
All students at the School must be enrolled in the School for at least 3/4 of each 
school day. Therefore, no student at the School will be allowed to dually enroll if they 
do not plan to attend at least 3/4 of each school day at the School. In addition, no 
student at the School will be allowed to dually enroll if any course, program, or 
activity to be taken by the student at a private school, home school, or another public 
school would conflict with the student’s schedule at the School. Moreover, dual 
enrollment in the School will only be allowed if the School is the student’s primary 
LEA, meaning the LEA which reports the student to be in regular membership and, if 
applicable, special education membership (sometimes referred to as the student’s 
“school of record”).  

  
For a request for dual enrollment to be considered by the School, the request should 
be submitted to the Principal or Executive Director using the approved forms 
provided by the School.  

  

Students who are dually enrolled in the School will only take at the School the state 
standardized tests and other assessments for the subjects for which they receive 
instruction at the School.  

  



 

 

Policy Not Applicable to Statewide Online Education Program  
  
This policy does not apply to a student’s participation in the School through the  
Statewide Online Education Program (the “SOEP”). Participation in the School through 
the SOEP is governed by Utah state law and rule, including but not limited to Title 53F, 
Chapter 4, Part 5 of the Utah Code and Utah Administrative Code Rule R277-726.  

 


